
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

Keyword(s): 
Assembly, Speaker, MLA, Salary 
 
Amendments appended: 7 of 1992, 9 of 1994, 16 of 1995, 5 of 1997, 12 of 
1998, 12 of 1999, 4 of 2003
 

 
Act 19 of 1954  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

The Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances and Pension 
Act, 1954



Orissa Act No. 19 of 1954

*The Orissa Legislative Assembly Members'
1[Salary, Allowances and Pension] Act, 1954

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 3rd December 1954, first published in

an extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, dated the 13th  December 1954.]

AN ACT TO PROVIDE FOR THE SALARY, ALLOWANCES & PENSION OF

THE MEMBERS OF THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY.

WHEREAS it is expedient to provide tor the Salary, Allowances & Pension

of the Members of the Orissa Legislative Assembly :

It is hereby enacted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in the Fifth

Year of the Republic of India, as follows :-

1. Short title and Commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the

Orissa Legislative Assembly Members 1[Salary, Allowances & Pension] Act, 1954.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Definitions:- In this Act unless the context otherwise requires "

(a) "Assembly" means the Orissa Legislative Assembly;
2[(a-1)"Chief Whip" and "Deputy Chief Whip" shall respectively mean those

Members of the Assembly who are for the time being the Government Chief Whip

and the Government Deputy Chief Whip;]

(b) "Committee" means a Select Committee or other Committee of the

Assembly and includes any Committee appointed by Government for a purpose

connected with the business of the Assembly and declared by Government to be

a Committee of the Assembly;
3[(b-1) "Leader of the Opposition" means that Member of the Assembly

* Published in Orissa Gazette Extraordinary No.  dated 13.12.1954

1. Substituted vide Orissa Act 3 of 1977

2. Inserted vide Orissa Act 10 of 1969

2. Substituted vide Orissa Act 7 of 1992

The Odisha   Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. Date : 13th December 1954



2

who is for the time being, the Leader in the Assembly of the Party in Opposition

to the Government having the greatest numerical strength not being less than

one-tenth of the total membership of the Assembly and recognised as such by

the Speaker.

Explanation-When there are two or more Parties in Opposition to the

Government in the Assembly having the same numerical strength, the Speaker

shall, having regard to the status of the parties, recognise any one of the Leaders

of such parties as the Leader of the Opposition for the purpose of this Act and

such recognition shall be final and conclusive.]

(c) "Member" means a Member of the Assembly, who has taken his seat

therein, other than the Speaker or Deputy Speaker of the Assembly or a Minister

or a Parliamentary Secretary of the Government of Orissa; and

(d) "Place of residence" means the place where a Member ordinarily resides

within the State.

3. Salary:- There shall be paid and delivered a salary;

(a) at the rate of  1[thirty five thousand rupees] to every Member,

other than the Leader of the Opposition, the Chief Whip and the

Deputy Chief Whip;

(b) at the rate of 1[forty thousand rupees] to the Leader of the

Opposition and the Chief Whip and

(c) of 1[thirty six thousand rupees] to the Deputy Chief whip;

Provided that a Member may, if he so desires, forgo either in full or in part,

his salary for any period not less than three consecutive months at a time during

the tenure of his office, communicating the intention forthwith so to do the Secretary

of the Assembly.

4. Allowances:- There shall be paid to every member the following

allowances, except the allowances mentioned in 2[clauses (a), (d), (e), 3[(f) and

(g)] in case of the Leader of the Opposition, the Chief Whip and the Deputy Chief

Whip, at the rates specified against each :-
3[(a) Constituency Allowance and Secretarial Allowance at the rate of

1[twenty thousand rupees] per mensem for all members not

otherwise provide for by or under the provisions of this Act.]
4[(b) Daily allowance of "

(i) 1[one thousand and five hundred rupees] a day for each day

of actual residence at the place where the Assembly or a

Committee meets or at a place to make an oath or affirmation

as required by Article 188 of the Constitution of India; and

(ii) 1[two thousand rupees] a day for going out-side the State to

1. Substituted vide O.A. No. 14 of 2017, O.G.E. No. 1681 dated 18.10.2017.

2. Substituted vide O.A. No. 4 of 2003, O.G.E. No. 163 dated 1.2.2003.

3. Substituted vide O.A. No. 4 of 2011, O.G.E. No. 1120 dated 12.05.2011

4. Substituted vide O.A. No. 12 of 1998, O.G.E. No. dated 08.10.1998



3

attend Conferences and Meetings and on Study Tours.

(c) Travelling Allowance for the journey each way between the

member's place of residence and the place of meeting of the

Assembly, or a Committee, or between such place of residence

and the place where the Member makes an oath or affirmation

as aforesaid;

(i) in case of a journey by railway double the fare of the Air-

conditioned, two tier and in case of journey by steamer double

the second class fare; and

(ii) in case of journey by road 2[one rupee and fifty paise] per

each kilometer travelled:
1[Provided that if a Member performs the journey in his own car or hired

car, he shall draw road mileage at the rate of fifteen rupees per kilometer if the

jorney is made inside the State and twenty rupees per kilometer, if jorney is

made outside the State.]

(d) Conveyance Allowance at the rate of 1[fifteen thousand rupees] a month.
3[(e) Books, journals and periodicals allowance at the rate of 1[two thousand

rupees] per month.

(f) Electricity consumption allowance at the rate of 1[five thousand rupees]

per month.]
4[4A. 5[Fixed allowance for travel not connected with duty:- There

shall be paid to each Member, other than the Leader of the Opposition, the Chief

Whip and the Deputy Chief Whip, a sum of 2[rupees four thousand] per mensem

to defray the cost of travelling which is not connected with the business of the

Assembly or a Committee thereof or a Committee or Body constituted Jay the

State or Central Government by a Resolution or an order.]
6[4AA. Advance for purchase of a Jeep, Motor Cycle, Scooter or a

like vehicle:- (1) A Member shall be entitled to an advance not exceeding 7[one

lakh rupees] for purchase of a jeep, motor cycle, scooter or a like vehicle to be

recovered with interest within a period not exceeding five years from the date of

its sanction or before the expiry of his office as a Member of the Assembly during

the term of which the advance is sanctioned, whichever is shorter.

(2) The terms and conditions governing the sanction of the advance under

Sub-section (1) including the rate of interest to be charged and. the manner of

sanction and recovery thereof, shall be such as may be prescribed by rules

made by the State Government in that behalf.]

1. Substituted vide O.A. No. 14 of 2017, O.G.E. No. 1681 dated 18.10.2017.

2. Substituted vide O.A. No. 4 of 2003, O.G.E. No. 163 dated 1.2.2003.

3. Inserted vide O.A. No. 4 of 2003, O.G.E. No. 163 dated 1.2.2003.

4. Inserted vide O.A. No. 20 of 1976.

5. Substituted vide O.A. No. 14 of 1979.

6. Substituted vide O.A. No. 11 of 1986.

7.. Substituted vide O.A. No. 12 of 1998, O.G.E. No. dated 08.10.1998



4

1[4B. Pension:- 5[(1). With effect from the commencement of the-Orissa

Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances and Pension (Amendment)

Act, 2[2017], there shall be paid a pension of 2[thirty thousand rupees] per mensem

to every person who has held office for a period of 4[one years], whether continuous

or not, as a Member of the Assembly :

Provided that where any person has held office for a period exceeding five

years, there shall be paid to him an additional pension of 2[two thousand rupees}

per mensem for every year in excess of five years so, however, that, in no case

the total amount of the additional pension together with the pension, to be so

paid, shall exceed 2[seventy thousand rupees] per mensem] ;

Provided further that where any person has held office as a Member of

Assembly twice for its duration as provided in clause (1) of article 172 of the

Constitution, whether consecutively or not, and who is not entitled to any pension

under the foregoing provisions of this Sub-section, he shall, with effect from the

commencement of the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances

and Pension (Amendment) Act, 2[2017] be entitled to a pension of 2[thirty thousand

rupees] per mensem;

Explanation - (i) The period for which a person has held office as a Member

of the Assembly shall mean "

(a) where such person is elected in General Election held for the

purpose of constituting a new Assembly, the period beginning

with the date of publication of the notification of the Election

Commission under Section 73 of the Representation of the People

Act, 1951; or

(b) where such person is elected in a bye-election to the Assembly,

the period beginning with the date of his election referred to in

Section 67-A of the said Act; and ending with, in each case, the

date on which his seat becomes vacant.

(ii) in computing the aforesaid period, the period preceding the 26th day of

January, 1950 for which a person has held such office, shall not be taken into

account;
3[(iii) where such person has held office for a part of the year exceeding six

months, it shall be treated as one year for the purpose of calculation of pension.]

(2) Where any person entitled to pension under Sub-section (1) "

(i) is appointed to the office of the Governor of any State or the

Administrator of any Union Territory; or

(ii) becomes a Member of the Council of States or the House of the

People or of any Legislative Assembly; or

1. Inserted vide O.A. No. 3 of 1977.

2. Substituted vide O.A. No. 14 of 2017, O.G.E. No. 1681 dated 18.10.2017.

3. Inserted vide O.A. No. 7 of 2007, O.G.E. No. 1484 dated 23.8.2007.

4. Substituted vide O.A. No. 12 of 1999.



5

(iii) is employed on a salary under the Central Government or any

State Government, or any Corporation owned or controlled by

the Central Government or any State Government or under any

local authority or becomes otherwise entitled to any remuneration

from such Government, Corporation or local authority;

such persons shall not be entitled to any pension under Sub-section (1)

for the period during which he continues to hold such office or as such member

or is so employed, or continues to be entitled to such remuneration :

Provided that where the salary payable to such person for holding such

office or being such member or so employed, or where that remuneration referred-

to in clause (iii) payable to such person, is in either case, less than the pension

payable to him under Sub-section (1), such person shall be entitled only to

receive the balance as pension under that Sub-section.

(3) Where any person entitled to pension under Sub-section (1) is entitled

to any other pension, such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under

Sub-section (1) in addition to such other pension; and

(4) In computing the number of years for the purpose of Sub-section (1),

the period during which a person has served as Minister or Speaker or Deputy

Speaker as defined in the Orissa Ministers, Salaries and Allowarices Act, 1952

or the Orissa Legislative Assembly Speaker's Salary and Allowances Act, 1960

or the Orissa Deputy Speaker's Salary and Allowances Act, 1959 respectively by

virtue of his membership in the Assembly shall also be taken into account.]

(5)(a) In the event of the death of member who was eligible for pension

or already in receipt of pension under Sub-section (1), his/her

spouse shall be entitled to receive as family pension a sum

equivalent to such pension till his/her death or remarriage

whichever is earlier.

(b) In the event of the death of member while continuing in office as

such, whose spouse is not entitled to receive family pension

under clause (a) his/her spouse shall be entitled to receive as

family pension till his/her death or remarriage, whichever is earlier,

a sum equivalent to an amount which the member would have

received had he held office for a period of one year as member :

Provided that the conditions laid down in Sub-sections (2) and (3) shall

mutatis mutandis apply to holders of family pension.

5. Amenities:- (1) A member shall be entitled to such medical facilities for

himself and for members of his family and to such housing, telephone and postal

facilities as may be prescribed by rules under Section 7 :

Provided that a member who is Leader of the Opposition shall, so long he

continues to be such leader and for a period of fifteen days immediately thereafter,

be entitled without payment of rent to the use of residence.

Explanation - For the purpose of this provision 'residence' includes the



6

staff quarters and other buildings appurtenant thereto.

(2) The Chief Whip and the Deputy Chief Whip shall, throughout the period

they continue in office as such and for a period of fifteen days thereafter, each be

entitled without payment of rent, to the use of a furnished residence or in lieu

thereof to a house rent allowance of one hundred rupees per month and no

charge shall fall on them personally in respect of the maintenance of such

furnished residence provided to them.

Explanation - For the purpose of this Sub-section 'residence' includes the

staff quarters and other buildings appurtenant thereto and 'maintenance' in relation

to a residence shall mean only the payment of Municipal tax and the installation

of electricity and water taps.

6.  Accommodation in inspection Bungalows etc.:- Notwithstanding

anything contained in any other law, rules or orders for the time being in force

and subject to rules to be made by the State Government; member shall be

entitled to free accommodation in Inspection Bungalows, Dak Bungalows, Circuit

Houses or Rest Houses maintained by the State Government or Local Authority

within the State.

7. Power to make rules:- (1) The State Government may make rules for

carrying out the purpose of this Act.

(2) In particular and without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing

powers such rule may provide "

(a) for determining the period during which daily allowances and

travelling allowances are to be drawn;

(b) for deductions from such allowances and the salary fixed under

Section 3 under such circumstances as they consider fit;

(c) for medical, housing, telephone and postal facilities;

(d) for determining the staff and the privileges of the Leader of the,

Opposition, the Chief Whip; and the Deputy Chief Whip; and

(e) for regulating the payment of pension.

(3) All rules made under this Act shall be laid as soon as possible after

they are made before the Orissa Legislative Assembly for a total period of fourteen

days which may be comprised in one Session or in two or more Sessions and

shall be subject to such modifications as the Assembly may make during the

said period.

8. Continuance of the existing rules:- Notwithstanding anything

contained in this Act but subject to the provisions of Section 4 thereof, the rules

made under the provisions of Section 5 of the Orissa Legislative Assembly

Member's Salaries and Allowances Act, 1938, shall continue in force until such

rules are made in this behalf under this Act.

9. Interpretation:- Except as otherwise provided, if any question arises

as to the interpretation of this Act or of the rules made there under or rules



7

referred to in Section 8, the matter shall be referred to the State Government and

their decision shall be final.

10. Repeal:- The Orissa Legislative Assembly Member Salaries and

Allowances Act, 1938 is hereby repealed.



ORISS A ACT 7 OF 1992 

*THE ORISSA LJ3GISLATM3 ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, 
AIILOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1991 

[Received the assent of the  Governor 00 i fie 23rd January, I992 first publirhed in an 
e~rtaordit~ary.issse of the Orjssa Gazct te, dated tlze 30th Jariuary 19921 

A N  A C T  FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 
MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES A N D  PENSION ACT, 1954. 

BE it tnacled by the Legislature of the Srate of Orissa in the Forty-sccond 
Year of t h ~ :  Republic of India as follows:- 

Sllorl ritle 1. This Act may be called the OrissaLegislative Assembly Members' Salary, 
~IIowances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1991. 

Aniendmeot 2. In the Orissa Legislativz Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances and Pecsion 
or 

scctton 2. 
Act, 1954, in section 2, for clause (b-1) .  the iollowing clausc shall be substituted, 

: namely :- 

' ( b - 1 )  "Leader of the Opposition" meana that Member of the Assembly who is, 
for the time being, the Leader in the Assembly of the party in Opposition ro the 
Government having the matest numerical srrcngth, not being less than one-tenth 
of thc total membership or the Asembly, and rccognised as such by thc Speaker. 

Explanaliorr-Whcn there are two or more parties in opposition to the 
Government in the Assembly having the same numerical strength, the Speaker 
shall, having regard to the status or tbe parties, recognise any one of the Leaders 
of such parties as rhe Leader of the Opposition for the purpose of rhis A-ct, and 
such recognilion shall be final and conclusive.'. 

*For thc Bill, sce Orbsa Gazelte, Extraordina~. dated l hc 101h Scptornbcr 1991 (No. 1094) 



ORISSA ACT 9 .OF 1994 

*THE ORTSSA LEGISLATI!% ASSEMBLY IVIEMBEBS' SALARY, 
ALLOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMEMI') ACT, 1994 

, f~eccivrdthc a s s c n t ~ f t b e G o v c . s n ~ r o u I l ~ c ~ ~ d h . l u y  1994, first published i n an  
extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, datcd thl: 9th hi& 1994. ] , 

AN ACT FURTHBR TO AMEND THE ORISh LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MHMBERG' 
SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 1954. 

B . E it enacted by the Lcgislatw of the State of Orissa in the Forty-fifth Year 
of the Republic of lndia as follows:- 

Short tWe. 1. ' i h s  Act'may be callcd thc Orissa Lcgislaiivr: Assembly Members' Salary, 
~ ~ o w a u c e s '  and Pcn:n.;iun (Amindmcnti Act; 193$. 

c 

Amenamcat of 2. in the Orissn LegisIative Assembly Mernbcrs, Salary, Allowances and Pension . 
&on (-B Act,' 1954, in section 4-13,- Orissa 19 of 1954 ..4u 

'(a) for sub-section (1) cxcluding tbc- Explanation thereto, the foliowing shall 
be substituted, namc1y:- 

' '(1) With effect from the commencement of 'the Orissa Lrgislative 
Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances and Pension (~mendmcnt) ' Act, 
1994 t h ~ ~  shall be paid a, pension of scvzn hundred rupces pcr mtiucm to  
evcrypwson whoh3sbeId05cefor a pried of four ycars,wkthtr 
continuous or not, as a mcmbcr of the Assembly: 

Provided I hpt wherc any prrson has hcld oficc for a period cxcccdins ~ L C  

ycars, there shall be paid to bim an additional pension of one hundred 
ropees per m m e m  fur i & r y  ycur j~ ~xccss 01 GVI: YC*US: 

Provided further that where any pension has held office as a member of '. 
.Aqs:~n'>l:~ :r:lc* fcr i t s  dl-tr-tion zs provided in clausc (I) of article 171 . 
of the Constitution, whether cbnsccutivcly or not, and who is not entitled 
to any pension under lhe foregoing provisions of this sub-tion, he shall, 
clitb r f f ~ t  from the commcnsomPnt of th? Oriss. Lc,qisl;.tive Assembly 
Mcmbcrs' Salary, Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1994, lx 
entitled to a penslon of seven hundred r o p e 6  per memem" ; 

( b )  ia clause (ii) of the Enplamtion to sub-section (1) in sub-clanre (b)for the 
words "i5rtr yrars," 'tnc wards "10ur ycai.sJ' shall be substiiuted;' 

(c) for sub-section (31, the following sub-section shall bc substituttd, ~ e l y : -  

"(3) Wherc any peaon ontitled to pension under sub-section (I) i s  
eatitlad to any othef pension, such pmon shall be entitled io receive the 
pcnsion under subsection (I) in addition to such oihcr pension"; and 

(6) in clausc (b) of eubection (3, for fbe words "five . years", words 
c'~ourYtars" shall be subetityted. 

, * Far the Bill see Orism Gazette, Extraordinary, dated the 5th April 1994 (&. 396) 



THE OlUSSA LEGISLATXYE ASSEMBLY MElMBERS SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND 
, - 

P q q O f J  (AMENDMENT) ACT,1995 

TABLE . . OF CONTENTS . 

SECTIONS 

1. Short titlb and commencement' 

2. Ameq*?~! 04 sectiop 3: 

3. Amendmea,t of section 4 
4- Ame?4~e.p.t~ % sW~8 $4 

. 5. Amendment of sktion 4-AG 



*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBEI~S.? SALARY, ' ALLOW- 
. ANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1995 

[ Rewived the assent of the President on the 27th August 1995 -first published 
in an extraordinary issuc of the Oi-issa Gawile, dated the 28th August 1995 ] 

. I 

AN mmmR To A M ~ N D  THE OWSM LEG[sLnnw ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SIIL-, 
ALLOWA~'CES AND PENSION ACT, 1954. 

: - 

Bn it enacted by the Legislature of tho Stab of Orissa in the Forty-sixth Year of , - ' 

the Republic of India as fol1ows:l- 

S b ~ r t  tltl; . 1. ( I )  This +t may be called the Orissa Legislative Ascembly l e m b k '  Salary, 
and mmmc- Allowances and Ponsion (Amendment) A.ct, 1995. , 

m c n t .  ) 

(2) It shall come inlo'forcc on the 1st day of Augu:t, 1995.. 
, . 

, 2. 1. thc Oriwa Logislalive Assembly Members' Salary, Allawances and Pornion 
Act, 1954 (hereinafter refcrred lo a6 the principal Act), jn the third pran'so to 
section 3, for the words "four hundred fifty rupees", the words "six hundred and Orissa 

, fifty rupees" shall be substituted. 1901 1954. 

Amndmcnt - 3. In ration 4 of the principal Act.-- 
' 

" ol saction A 
(0 in .clause (b), for tlie words "seventy-five rup@~",~the words "one hundred 

and M l y  rupees", sl~all  be substituted ; and 
. . 

( i i )  in clause (4. for thc words "three hundred and 'fifty mpees", the words 
"seven hundred and firty rupees" shall be substituted. - 

Amendment 4. In the principal Act, for section 4-A, the following section shall be substi- 
tnted, namely:- +A. 

, , 

m'c4-A. There shall bc paid to each Member a sum of rupees two thousand per . 
- mensem to defray the cost of travelling which is not. connected with the, busi- 

ness of the Assembly or a Cammiltee therenf or a Committee or Body consti- - 

tuted by the State,or Central Government by a Resolution or an order.". 

Amdndmcnt 5. In the principal Act, in section 4-AA, for tbc words. ''eighteen thousand. ' , 
of section -' rupee's", the words "thirty-five thousand rupees" shall be substttuted. 

-; 4-AA. 

. *For (he Bill, see Orisso Gazefre, Extraordidary, dated thc 29th ~ u l y  1996 (No. $82) 



.THE U ~ S A  LEGTSLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND 
PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997 

[Recekd the U S S ~ I I ~  of iIre Goverllor on the Z O b  May 1997, Jrs; p~tblisJied In an extraordinpry 
issue of the Orisse Gazette, doted the 26th May 19973 

. AN ACT' FVR- TO AMEND THE ORISSA LE~JSLATIVR A S S W L Y  MHMBER~' SALARY,: 
ALLOWANCE AND PENSION ACT, 1954 

BE i t  enacted -by the ~sgislatire of the State of Orissa in me Forfy-elghth 
Year of the Republ~c-of India as follows:- 

Short Htlo. 1. This Act may be callcd the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, 
AUawances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1997. 

  mid mat 2. In section 4 of the Orissa 'bdslative Assembly Members' Salary, mowances 
of and Pension Act,- 1954, in clause (c),- 

%don 4. 
Odaa An 
190f199. . 

(i) in sub-clause (i), for the words "highest class available immediately 
below the Air-conditioned class", the words ,'-Air-cond~ioned, Two 

- Tier" shall be substituted; and 

(ifl in sub-clause (io, for the words "forty paiee", .the words "Wty paise" 
shall be substituted. 

*For the Bill see O m a  Gazette, ~xrrabrdinar~, dated tho 5th April 1997 CNo. 430). 



Q R D A '  ACT 12 OF '1 998 

THE ORTSSA L,EGISf,4mVE ASSEMRLY  MEMBERS^ SALARY, ALLOWANCES 
AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998 

TABLE OF CONTENTS . - . . .  

1. Short title and commencement 

2. Amendment of section 3 
, - 

q - 3. ~mkdmeat  of section 4 

4. Amendment of sectioa 4-A 

9 ., - 
5, Amendment of section 4 - M  

6, Amendment of section 4-B 



i 

O R ~ W A  ACT 12 OF 1998 

THF, ORISSA LEGISATXVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AM) 
PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998 

Z [ Received tlte asse,rt of the Goverjror 011 IIE 28th Sepletrrter 1998, $rst pithlished it1 exlraordlllarl 
isstre of [he 01 isia Gazette, dared the 8rl1 October 1998 j 

BE it enacted by the Ltgirlaturc of the slate of Orina in !he Forty-ninth Year of 
the Republic of India as fo1lcws:- 

Short title 1. (1) This Act may Ee callcd the Orissa 1-c-gislativc Asscrnbty Members' Salary, 
and Allowances and Pznsion (Amendment) Ad, 1998. cornmena- 

meat. 
(2) It shall come into force on the 1st day of August, 1998. 

Mmndment 2. I* thc Orissa Legislative Assembly Mcrnbcrs' Salary, Allowances and Pension Orissa ~d 4 
Act, 1954 Ehercinafier relcrred to  as thc principal Act),- section 3. 19 of 1954. 

(i) for section 3 excluding the pra~isas thereto, the following section shall 
be sub~tituted, namely :- 

''3. There shall be paid and delivered a salary- 

(a) at the rate of two thousand and five hundred rupees t icvery membtn 
other than thc kader  of the Opposition, the Chief Whip and the Depuly . 
Chief Whip ; 

(b)  a t  the rate of five thousand rupees to the Leader of the Opposition a n d  
the Chief Whip; and 

(c) of four thousand rupees to the Deputy Chief Wbip, net a month:"; and 
( i i )  the second and third provisos to section 3 shalI be omitted. 

Amendment 3. In  the principaI Act, in section 4,- 
of 

srction 4. [ i )  for the opening portion, the folIowing shaIl be substituted, namely:- 
"There shall bc paid to every - membzr the following allowances, cxccpt 

the alIowances mentioned in clauses (a) and (d) in case of the Leadcr 
of the Opp~sition, the Chief Whip and the Deputy Chief Whip, at the 
rates specsed a p ~ a s t  each:-" 

(ii) in claur;e (a), for the words "nine hundred rupees", the words "two 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

( i j i )  for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 
"(b) Daily allowance of- 

(1) thrcc hundred rupzzs a day for cach day of actual residence at the 
place where lhe Assembly or a Committee meets or at a p'ace to 
make an oath or nairmation as rcquired by Article 188 of the Consti- 
tution of India; and 

( i f )  four hundred rupees a day for going outside the State to attend 
Conferences and Meetings and on Study Tours."; 

(iv) in sub-clause (ii)  of clause (c), for the words "fifty paiseT*, the words 
LLone rupee" shall bc substituted; 

(v)  in the proviso to  subclausc (i i)  of clause (c), for thc words #gat the same 
rate as admissible to a Government servant of thc first grade on tour", the 
words "at the rate of three rupees and fifty paise per kilo.me~re" shall be 
substituted; and 

(YO in clause (d), for the words "seven hundred and fifty rupees", the wor& 
'&one, thousand and five hundred rupees", shdl be substitutcd. ' 

' For ths &U, see OrDfa Gnzelte Dtraordiwry dated tho 7td Auyst, 1998 ( 1007 ) 



Amendment 4. Tn the principal Act, in section 4-A, for the words "2 sum of rupees two 
of thousand", thc commas .and words "other than the Lc~d.dsr the Oppnsilion, the 

uqioo4-*m Chief Whip and the.Dcputy,Chicf Whip, a sum of rupees thrce . lhcusand" shall be 
subs t iluted. 

~hendment 5. In the principal Act, in section 4-AA, for the words acthirty.fivc thou~and 
rupees", the words "rupees one iakh" shall be sub;iituted. s~cti0~4-AA. 

Amendmet 6. In the principal Act, in seclion 4-B,- 
0r 

mection 4-B. . . 

(i) for sub-section (1) excluding the second proviso and the ~ x ~ l a n a t i o n  
thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:- . , 

"(I) ,With effect from the commencement of the Orissa Legislatit e Assrmbly . 

Members' Salary, AlIowances 2nd Pensicn (Amcndmrnt) Act, 1998, ' 

rhere shall be a pension of two thousand rupees pcr mensem 
to  every person who has held office for a perioc! of two years, whether 
continuous or not, as 8 member of the Assembly: 

Provided that where any person has held oflice for a period exceeding five 
years, there shall be paid to him an additional pcnsion of tivo hundred 
rupees pcr mensem for every year in erczss olfivc years:"; 

(ii) in thc Explanati~n to sub-section (I), for clause (ii), the f o l l o w i ~  clause 
shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(ii) cornpuling the aforcsaib period, the pericd preceding the 
26th day of January, 1950 for wbich a person has held such oilice, 
shall not be taken inlo account." ; and 

(lii) inclause(b) of sub-section 15) for tho words "four years", the words 
"two years'' shalI be substituted. . 



ORISSA ACT 12 OF 1999 

*THE ORISSA LEGtSLATLVE ..1SSE\I BLY 'ME-\IBERSp SALARY, ALLO~VANCFS AND 
E~ENSION (AMENDMLNTI ACT, 1999 

[ R ~ z i v d  Ihc assent of rhc Governsr on the 4th Oztobcr 1999 first ~uhlI:hcd in an ex~r , iordj~ lar~  
issue of the Ori~srl Gdzette, dakd the Slh Oc~ober, 19991 

AN .9CT FURTHER TO AMEND THE OKISSA. LEGISLATIVE ASSEMI3LY MEMBERS' 
SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENS LO^ ACT, 4954. 

BE it cnacrcd by ihc Lcgislaturc. of lhe Stale nf Orissa i n  t hc Fiftieth Year 
of tho Republic of 11ldIa as rollows: - 

Short ~itle. 1.  This Acl may be called [he Orissa Legislative A~scmbly Members, Salary, 
' 

o Allorvances arld Pcnsioa (Amendment) Act, 1999. 

Awandmcnt 2. !n section 4-B cf the Orissa Lc~islat ivc i~ssernbly Members' Salary, 
4 of seaion AUuwances and Pension Acl,' 1954,- Orissa Act 

4-B. 19 of 1954. 

(i) in sl~b-section (1). f o r  thc words &'IWO ycarsyp, the \vurrls "onc yearw 
sbaII be substi tuied; 

(ii) in sccond proviso to sub-scclicn (I), for thc figurr ''I994" and 
the words "seven hundred rup:es9' the  figorc and words "1998" 
and ' ' t ~ o  t h o u s a ~ ~ d  rupees" shall respectively be substi Iutcd. and 

(iii) in clause (b) of sub-seclion (5 ) ,  for [he worals "trvo years?' the 
words "onc p a r "  shall be tiubstiluted. . 

For the Bill ske Orissa G#zc.fie, Extaordinary, dated the (No,) 



ORlSSA ACT 4.OF 2003 

THE ORlSSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES 

AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2002 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 

I .  short title. 

2. ' Amendment of section 3. 

3. Amendment of section 4. 

4. Amendment of section 4-A. 
. , 

5. Amendment of section 4-B. 



* THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, 
ALLOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2002 

[ Received the assent of the Governor on the 25th January, 2003, first 
published in an extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, dated the 1st 

February, 2003 (No. 163) ] 

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSlON ACT, 1 954. 

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State OF Orissa in the Fifty-Lhird 

Year of the Republic of India as follows :- 
.- . 

' Shcrl tilie. 1. This Act may be calIed the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' 

Salary, Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Acf, 2002. 

Amendmenl 2. In'section 3 of Ihe Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Al- . 

of seclion 3. 
lowances and Pension Act, 1.954 (hereinafter referred to as the principal AcL).- Orissa ~~t 

19 01 1954: 
(i) in clause (a), for [he words "two thousand and five hundred 

rupees", the words "five lhousand rupees" shalt be subsliiuted ; 

{ii) in clause .(b), for the words "five thousand rupees", the words "six 
thousand rupees" shall be subslituted ; and 

(iii) in clause (c), for lhe words "Tour thousand rupees", (he words "five 
lhousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

Amendment 3. In section 4 of the principal Act, - 
of secriop 4. 

(i) in the opening portion, for the words, brackets and lellers "clauses 

(a) and (d)", the words, brackets and letters "clauses (a), (d), (e) 

and (f)" shall be subsliluted ; 

(ii) in clause (a), for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "three 

-thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(iii) in clause (c),- 

(a) in sub-clause (ii), for lhe words "one rupee", the words "one 

rupee and fifty paise" shall be subslituted ; and 

(6) in the proviso lo sub-clause (ii), for the words "three rupees and 

fifty paise", the words "four rupees and fifty paise" shall be 

subslituted ; 

(iv) in clause (dl,  for the words "one thousand and five hundred 

rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall be subslituted ; 

and 
- - 

' For the Bill. see Orissa Gazelte, Extraordinary daled We 24th December, 2002 (No. 2347). 



26 

(v) after clause (d), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely :- 

"le) Books, journals and periodicals allowance at Ihe rate of two 

hundred rupees per month. 

(0 Electricity consumption allowance at the rate of five hundred . 

rupees per month.". 

Amendment of 4. In section 4-A of the principal Act, for the words "rupees three thou- 
section 4-A. 

sand", the words "rupees four thousandt' shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 5. In section 4-B of the principal -Act, in sub-section (1 1,- 
seclion 4-0. 

(i) for the figure "1998" and Ihe words "two thousand rupees" 

occurring in the opening portion, the figure "2002" anq the words 
"three thousand rupeesn shall respectively be substituted : 

{ii) in the firs[ proviso, for Ihe words "two hundred rupees per mensem 

for every year in excess of five yearsn, the words "four hundred 
rupees per mensem for every year in excess of five years so, 
however, that, in no case, the total amount of the additional 

pension together with Ihe pension, to be so paid, shal exceed ten 
thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted ; and 

(iii) in the second proviso, for the figure "1998" and the words "two 

thousand rupees", the figure "2002" and words "three thousand 
rupees" shall respectively be substituted. 


	1992OR7.pdf
	1994OR9.pdf
	1995OR16.pdf
	1997OR5.pdf
	1998OR12.pdf
	1999OR12.pdf
	2003OR4.pdf



